
Birthday Parties
I would like to encourage you to

send or come for a birthday parly for your
kindergartner. A11 birthday parties will be
at2:45. Your child will be in charge of
the snack for that day. Please do not send
goodies bags or gifts to this parfy. If you
would like to send a gift for our classroom
from your child that would be a wonderful
idea.

Classroom Parties

Christmas Party, Tuesday, December 20th q72:30

God's Love Party, Tuesday, February l4th q,2:00

Resurrection Party, Thursday, April 5th @2:00

Homework
The scissor box will be the only

homework for the first nine weeks. I will
have one box that will rotate through all
the students. The scissor box will have a
pair of scissors and some scissor exercise
papers for them to practice on. Please

have them finish cutting out the papers the
night they bring it home. Return the cut up
papers, box, and scissors to school the next
day. This will be something fun, and will
help each student with their cutting skills.
We have one classroom rule with scissors:
Only cut paper. Please reinforce this rule
at home.

The kindergartners will start having
reading homework sometime in the second
nine weeks. They will have reading
homework on Tuesdays and Thursdays.
This does affect their reading grade.


